SENATE MEMBERS

Robert Stivers President, LRC Co-Chair **David Givens** President Pro Tempore **Damon Thayer** Majority Floor Leader Morgan McGarvey Minority Floor Leader Julie Raque Adams Majority Caucus Chair **Reginald Thomas** Minority Caucus Chair Mike Wilson Majority Whip **Dennis Parrett** Minority Whip



LEGISLATIVE RESEARCH COMMISSION

State Capitol 700 Capital Avenue Frankfort KY 40601

502-564-8100

Capitol Fax 502-564-2922 Annex Fax 502-564-6543 legislature.ky.gov

> Jay D. Hartz Director

HOUSE MEMBERS

David W. Osborne
Speaker, LRC Co-Chair
David Meade
Speaker Pro Tempore
Steven Rudy
Majority Floor Leader
Joni L. Jenkins
Minority Floor Leader
Suzanne Miles
Majority Caucus Chair
Derrick Graham
Minority Caucus Chair

Chad McCoy Majority Whip Angle Hatton Minority Whip

March 12, 2021

Dear Petitioners:

On January 13, 2021, you, the petitioners, Jacob Clark, Tony L. Wheatley, Randall L. Daniel, and Andrew D. Cooperrider, filed a petition for the impeachment of Governor Andrew G. Beshear. On February 23, 2021, the Impeachment Committee issued a report recommending against proceeding with the impeachment.

KRS 63.070 states, in relevant part, that if the committee issues such a report, "the petitioner shall be liable to witnesses and to the accused for the costs of investigation before the committee. These costs shall be taxed by the clerk of the house appointing the committee."

Attached to this letter are the complete lists of costs accrued by the Committee. Some of this information could be considered attorney work product. While the Committee recognizes that some information in attorney invoices may be protected by attorney-client privilege or the work-product doctrine, under these special circumstances it has opted not to redact any information from any invoices. It does, however, reserve the right to do so in the future.

Because multiple petitions were filed and taken up, not all costs will be attributed to you. Instead, the Committee has allocated to you an amount based on work done directly as a result of your petition and a proportion of associated administrative expenses. That proportion includes work done for the days on which yours was the only petition, as well as all other days divided by three. This was calculated because the Committee spent time working on the other petitions. The Committee has, of its own volition, already reduced some of the Governor's submitted costs.

The total amount is \$42,444.05. It is owed jointly and severally, with one exception. In other words, all petitioners are independently responsible for the full amount. Randall L. Daniel, having withdrawn from the petition, effective February 11, shall not be responsible for costs accrued after that date.

The Committee has chosen to allow you to object to any individual costs. A blanket objection to all costs will not be considered, as this is a mandatory process. Objections should be submitted electronically to the Clerk of the Committee at Elishea. Schweickart@LRC.KY.GOV by

March 16 at noon. If no objections are filed, the Committee will submit the bill of costs to the Clerk of the House for further action.

The Committee has treated this matter with the seriousness and gravity that it deserves and expects all petitioners to do so as well.

Sincerely,

Representative Jason Nemes

Son M. No

Chair

2021 RS Impeachment Committee

Cc: Amy Cubbage

In the COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

JACOB CLARK, TONY L, WHEATLEY, and ANDREW D. COOPERRIDER

PETITIONERS

v.

GOVERNOR ANDY BESHEAR

RESPONDENT

GOVERNOR BESHEAR'S BILL OF COSTS

In accordance with this Committee's request in its February 23, 2021 Report and Recommendation that the Governor submit a bill of costs pursuant to KRS 63.070 related to his defense of this impeachment petition, including attorney's fees, Governor Beshear states as follows:

Attorneys for Governor Beshear recorded a total of 159.5 hours in his defense, at a cost of \$17,730.85. This cost is based on an hourly rate for each attorney as calculated by Mary Elizabeth Bailey, Commissioner of the Department of Human Resources Administration within the Personnel Cabinet. Commissioner Bailey's methodology and calculated hourly rates are documented by Affidavit attached as Exhibit 1. The following table summarizes the cost of the attorney time by attorney name and applicable hourly rate as calculated by Commissioner Bailey. A detailed accounting of the attorneys' time is attached as Exhibit 2.

Attorney	Hourly Rate	Hours Worked	Total
Amy D. Cubbage	\$118.18	58.0	\$6,854.44
S. Travis Mayo	\$118.90	43.6. 34.2	\$5,184.04 .0 4066.38
Marc G. Farris	\$105.12	15.3	\$1,608.34
Taylor A. Payne	\$108.22	15.7	\$1,699.05
Shawn Chapman	\$83.55	9.2	\$768.66
Benjamin Long	\$109.12	2.5	\$272.80
T. Chad Thompson	\$70.40	2.8	\$197.12
Jacob Walbourn	\$93.56	0.7	\$65.49

TOTAL	Ψ23.30	159.5-	\$ 17,730.85- 16,613.19
Jessica Williamson	\$93.56	8.7	\$813.97
Shawna Kincer	\$88.98	3.0	\$266.94

The Governor respectfully requests the Committee to award these costs pursuant to KRS 63.070, and to order the remaining Petitioners to reimburse the Commonwealth for these expenses.

Dated: March 3, 2021

Respectfully submitted,

Amy D. Cubbage General Counsel

S. Travis Mayo

Chief Deputy General Counsel

Taylor A. Payne

Deputy General Counsel

Marc G. Farris

Deputy General Counsel

Office of Governor Andy Beshear

700 Capitol Avenue, Suite 106

Frankfort, KY 40601

amy.cubbage@ky.gov

travis.mayo@ky.gov

taylor.payne@ky.gov

marc.farris@ky.gov

Counsel for Governor Andy Beshear

Exhibit 1

AFFIDAVIT

Comes the Affiant, Mary Elizabeth Bailey, being first duly sworn, and hereby swears and deposes as follows:

- 1. My name is Mary Elizabeth Bailey, and I am over eighteen years of age and have personal knowledge of the matters set forth herein.
- 2. I am the Commissioner of the Department of Human Resources Administration within the Commonwealth of Kentucky Personnel Cabinet.
- 3. I have served in this capacity since July 2012. I have been employed by the Commonwealth of Kentucky in some capacity since May, 1995.
- 4. The Personnel Cabinet is the official custodian of all personnel records. Within the Cabinet, my department is the custodian of official documentation and reports related to employee payroll.
- 5. After a review of the Cabinet's records, I have determined and can attest to the following total hourly compensation rate (including salary and fringe benefits) for the below employees:

a.	Amy D. Cubbage	\$118.18
b.	S. Travis Mayo	\$118.90
c.	Marc G. Farris	\$105.12
d.	Taylor A. Payne	\$108.22
e.	Shawn Chapman	\$83.55
f.	Benjamin Long	\$109.12
g.	T. Chad Thompson	\$70.40
h.	Jacob Walbourn	\$93.56
i.	Shawna Kincer	\$88.98
i.	Jessica Williamson	\$93.56

Further, Affiant sayeth naught.

MARY ELIZABETH BAILE

COMMISSIONER

DEPT. OF HUMAN RESOURCES ADMINISTRATION

STATE OF KENTUCKY)
)
COUNTY OF FRANKLIN)
Til Commission in American	ras acknowledged before me on this the 2 nd day of
I ne foregoing instrument w	as acknowledged before the on this the 200 day of
March, 2021, by	reland.
My commission expires:	May 22, 2021
	Amen Waland
	NOTARY PUBLIC #579918

Exhibit 2

Time Recorded on Behalf of Governor Beshear

Amy D. Cubbage

1/13/2021

- 3.2 hours – Review and analyze impeachment petition; observe Committee meeting; discuss Committee meeting with office attorneys and staff; discuss response to the petition.

1/14/2021

- 2.0 hours – Analyze issues re content and format of response to impeachment petition; outline legal arguments for same.

1/15/2021

- 4.5 hours – Internal meeting re draft response to the petition and research to be performed; assign research to attorneys; perform research re claims in petition.

1/16/2021

- 1.5 hours –Draft response to petition.

1/17/2021

- 1.7 hours – Review research re various legal issues in petition; draft various sections for response to petition.

1/18/2021

- 6.5 hours —Continued drafting and editing of response to petition; review and analyze additional research.

1/19/2021

- 3.8 hours – Draft additional sections of response to petition; edit same.

1/20/2021

- 2.1 hours – Draft additional sections of response to petition; edit same.

1/21/2021

- 3.7 hours - Draft additional sections of response to petition; edit same.

1/22/2021

- 4.8 hours – Final edits and proofreading of response to petition; prepare exhibits; file petition response with committee.

1/26/2021

- 1.0 hours – Receive and review reply in support of petition; analyze issues re same.

<u>1/27/2021</u>

- 2.1 hours – Continued review of reply in support of petition; observe Committee hearing; receive and review correspondence from R. Daniel attorney; analyze issues re same.

1/28/2021

- 1.5 hours – Receive and review Committee letter requesting additional information; gathered records related to the request for additional information; performed legal research; draft response letter.

1/29/2021

- 1.5 hours – Draft letter to Committee.

1/30/2021

- 0.5 hours—Revise letter to Committee.

1/31/2021

- 1.5 hours – Revise letter to Committee

2/1/2021

- 2.1 hours – Finalize letter and provide to Committee.

2/4/2021

1.0 hours – Observe Committee meeting; receive and review letter from Committee requesting additional information.

2/5/2021

2.2 hours – Additional review of letter from Committee requesting additional information; telephone conference with Committee attorney re same; draft response to same.

2/6/2021

- 0.4 hours – Revise draft letter in response to Committee.

2/7/2021

- 0.3 hours – Additional revisions to draft letter in response to Committee.

2/8/2021

- 2.7 hours – Additional edits to draft letter; review materials to enclose with letter; telephone conference with Committee attorney re same; finalize and send letter and enclosures to Committee.

2/11/2021

- 1.2 hours – Observe Committee hearing.

2/22/2021

- 1.5 hours – Observe Committee hearing.

2/23/2021

- 3.5 hours – Observe Committee hearing.

2/24/2021

- 1.2 hours – Receive and review final Committee report.

TOTAL for Amy D. Cubbage: 58.0 hours

S. Travis Mayo

1/13/2021

- 1.0 hours – Discuss Committee proceedings and potential response to the petition; review the petition.

- 1.8 hours – Observe meeting of Committee; discussed Committee meeting with office attorneys and staff; discussed response to the petition.

1/14/2021

- 2.0 hours – Discuss organization and contents of response; draft outline of some of the legal arguments for the draft response to the petition.

1/15/2021

- 2.5 hours – Discuss draft response to the petition; discuss legal research to be performed; assign legal research to attorneys.

1/16/2021

- 2.0 hours Continued review of petition; discuss individual counts in the petition with attorneys; assign sections of the draft response to the petition for drafting; determine additional legal research needed for drafting the response to the petition; assign additional legal research.
- 0.8 hours Research and begin drafting sections for the response to the petition.

1/17/2021

- 0.8 hours Receive and review draft legal memorandum.
- 8.3 hours Receive and review draft legal memoranda; draft multiple sections for the response to the petition.

1/18/2021

- 1.5 hours Research for impeachment response.
- 0.5 hours Receive and review draft results of legal research.
- 2.0 hours Draft sections for the response to the petition.
- 1.3 hours Review and edit the draft response to the petition.

1/19/2021

- 0.3 hours – Research and edit draft response to the petition.

1/21/2021

- 1.3 hours – Review and edit draft response to the petition.

1/27/2021

- 0.6 hours Review reply to the petition.
- 1.7 hours Observe and analyze Committee hearing.

1/28/2021

2.5 hours – Receive and review Committee letter requesting additional information; gather records related to the request for additional information; perform legal research; draft section for letter.

1/29/2021

- 1.2 hours – Review draft letter to Committee; performed additional legal research; provided draft section for letter.

1/30/2021

- 1.0 hours – Review revised draft letter; perform additional legal research.

1/31/2021

- 0.3 hours – Review revised drafts of letter.

2/1/2021

- 0.2 hours – Review draft letter and provide edits to draft letter; discuss draft letter with attorneys.

2/4/2021

- 1.5 hours – Observe Committee meeting; discuss Committee meeting with co-counsel.

2/5/2021

- 1.0 hours – Review letter from Committee requesting additional information; discuss with attorneys; review draft response letter to Committee.

2/6/2021

- 0.2 hours – Review revised draft letter in response to Committee; discuss with attorneys.

2/7/2021

0.1 hours – Review revised draft letter in response to Committee; discuss with attorneys.

2/11/2021

- 1.2 hours – Observe Committee hearing.

2/22/2021

- 1.5 hours Observe Committee hearing.

2/23/2021

- 3.5 hours - Observe Committee hearing.

2/24/2021

- 1.0 hours – Receive and review final Committee report.

34.2

TOTAL for S. Travis Mayo:

43.6-hours

Marc G. Farris

1/15/2021

- 2.4 hours – Legal research for petition response.

1/16/2021

- 1.2 hours – Review petition; legal research for petition response.

1/17/2021

- 3.5 hours - Legal and fact research for petition response.

1/18/2021

- 5.2 hours - Legal research; draft, edit, revise section; review and revise response to Petition.

1/21/2021

- 1.2 hours – revise and edit draft response.

2/5/2021

 1.8 hours – draft and revise letter to Committee concerning production of records; discussion and email correspondence with co-counsel regarding records requested by Committee.

TOTAL for Marc G. Farris: 15.3 hours

Taylor A. Payne

2/15/2021

- 1.5 hours – Legal research for petition response.

2/18/2021

- 2.0 hours legal research for petition response.
- 3.5 hours drafting response to petition.

2/20/2021

- 1.6 hours – Revise and edit draft response to petition.

2/21/2021

- 3.0 hours – Draft, revise and edit draft response to petition.

2/22/2021

- 2.7 hours – Revise and edit draft response; prepare exhibits.

2/1/2021

- 0.4 hours – Edit response requested by Committee.

2/5/2021

- 1.0 hours – Revise second response to Committee; discuss response with co-counsel.

TOTAL for Taylor A. Payne: 15.7 hours

Shawn Chapman

1/15/2021

- 2.5 hours – Research re impeachment petition.

1/16/2021

- 6.7 hours – Continued research re impeachment petition; drafted legal memorandum summarizing findings of research.

TOTAL for Shawn Chapman: 9.2 hours

Benjamin Long

1/19/2021

2.5 hours – Discussed legal research assignment with colleagues; performed legal research re impeachment petition.

TOTAL for Benjamin Long: 2.5 hours

T. Chad Thompson

1/19/2021

- 0.3 hours Discuss research assignment with colleagues.
- 2.5 hours Perform legal research on impeachment petition.

TOTAL for T. Chad Thompson: 2.8 hours

Jacob Walbourn

1/19/2021

- 0.7 hours – Assist with coordination of legal research as assigned; review case law.

TOTAL for Jacob Walbourn:

0.7 hours

Shawna Kincer

1/17/2021

- 3.0 hours – Perform legal research and draft legal memorandum.

TOTAL for Shawna Kincer:

3.0 hours

Jessica Williamson

1/17/2021

- 8.5 hours – Perform legal research and draft legal memorandum.

1/19/2021

- 0.2 hours – Review section for the draft response to the petition; provide feedback on the section for the draft response for the petition.

TOTAL for Jessica Williamson: 8.7 hours



106 West Vine Street, Suite 800 P.O. Box 951 Lexington, Kentucky 40588-0951 (859) 255-2424

TAX ID: 61-0511733

February 24, 2021

LEGISLATIVE RESEARCH COMMISSION ATTN: GREG WOOSLEY, GENERAL COUNSEL DIRECTOR'S OFFICE CAPITOL, ROOM 300 700 CAPITOL AVENUE FRANKFORT, KY 40601 Invoice #:

Client #: Matter #: LE124

Billing Attorney:

710055 RKW

INVOICE SUMMARY

For professional services rendered and costs advanced through February 22, 2021:

RE: IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE RE: BESHEAR

Total Professional Services

\$ 24,290.50

Total Costs Advanced

\$.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 24,290.50

Client.Matter; LE124 . 710055

RE: IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE RE: BESHEAR

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
1/19/21	HR	IN PREPARATION OF DRAFTING MEMO, CONDUCTED RESEARCH ON PROCESS OF IMPEACHING THE GOVERNOR IN KENTUCKY, ALL DAY REVIEW OF CASELAW, IMPEACHMENT MATERIALS AND RELATED ARTICLES. TELECONFERENCE WITH REP. JASON NEMES ON GOING FORWARD. REVIEW OF DOCS. TELECONFERENCE WITH JASON NEMES. IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH REP NEMES, REVIEWED AND SUMMARIZED KY SUPREME COURT CASE, BESHEAR V. ACREE (100+ PAGES) AS IT PERTAINS TO IMPEACHMENT COUNTS AGAINST GOV. BESHEAR.	3.50
1/20/21	RKW	EXTENSIVE TELECONFERENCE WITH JASON NEMES, BRIDGET AND HUNTER. CONTINUE TO REVIEW IMPEACHMENT COUNTS AND SUMMARY OF BESHEAR CASE.	3.60
1/20/21	вмв	REVIEW PETITION, OPINIONS, AND OTHER MATERIALS OF NEW MATTER; EXTENSIVE PHONE CALL WITH REP. NEMES; FOLLOW UP CALLS AND EMAILS WITH TEAM	2.40
1/20/21	HR	IN PREPARATION OF DRAFTING MEMO FOR REP. NEMES TO PRESENT TO IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE, CONDUCTED RESEARCH RE THE TERM MISDEMEANOR AS IT WAS DEFINED AT COMMON LAW, BY THE FRAMERS, AND IN THE FEDERAL CONSTITUTION.	4.10
1/20/21	AB2	ATTEND AND TAKE NOTES FOR EXTENSIVE PHONE CONFERENCE BETWEEN KENT, BRIDGET, JASON NEMES AND HUNTER. PREPARE DETAILED MEMO TO FILE.	2.00
1/21/21	RKW	GO THROUGH ALL INITIAL BRIEFS AS PROVIDED BY COMMITTEE ON IMPEACHMENT. CONSTANT CONFERENCES WITH BRIDGET THROUGHOUT DAY, REVIEW DETAILED AUTHORITY ON WHAT CONSTITUTES A MISDEMEANOR, ALSO REVIEW MOTIONS/CASE LAW ON CLOSING SCHOOLS AND CHURCHES.	4.80
1/21/21	BMB	REVIEW MATERIALS FROM LAW CLERK (LEGAL RESEARCH)	.40
1/21/21	HR · .	IN PREPARATION OF DRAFTING MEMO FOR REP. NEMES TO PRESENT TO IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE, CONDUCTED RESEARCH RE THE TERM MISDEMEANOR AS IT WAS DEFINED AT COMMON LAW, BY THE FRAMERS, AND IN THE FEDERAL CONSTITUTION.	3.90
1/21/21	HR	IN PREPARATION OF DRAFTING MEMO FOR REP. NEMES TO PRESENT TO IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE, CONDUCTED RESEARCH RE STATE CONSTITUTIONS AND THEIR RESPECTIVE IMPEACHMENT PROVISIONS.	3.00
1/22/21	BMB .	LEGAL RESEARCH; CALL WITH REP. NEMES; CALL WITH KENT WESTBERRY; EXCHANGE AND REVIEW MATERIALS WITH LAW CLERK; REVIEW DRAFT;	2.60
1/22/21	HR	CONDUCTED RESEARCH RE MISDEMEANOR AS IT APPLIES TO THE KENTUCKY CONSTITUTION.	3.00
1/24/21	BMB	RECEIPT, REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GOVERNOR'S RESPONSE, OPINION LETTER OF SCHOLARS AND JURISTS; LEGAL RESEARCH; MULTIPLE TEXTS, CALLS AND EMAILS WITH DEFENSE TEAM	1.60
1/25/21	RKW	PREP FOR WEDNESDAY MEETING, GO THROUGH GOVERNOR'S RESPONSE.	2.40
1/26/21		GO THROUGH PETITIONER'S REPLY BRIEF.	1.20
1/26/21	BMB	RESEARCH FOR WHITE PAPER	1.40

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
1/26/21	BMB	REVIEW REPLY BRIEF AND EXHIBITS (INCLUDING TREASURER'S REPORT); MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH LAW CLERK; REVIEW AND REVISE MEMO TO KENT WESTBERRY (SEVERAL ROUNDS OF REVISIONS); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH KENT WESTBERRY; ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH	3.90
1/26/21	вмв	MYRIAD TEXTS AND RESPONSES WITH LAW CLERK; REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LEGAL RESEARCH SOURCES AND NEW DRAFT	1.10
1/26/21	HR ·	DRAFTED BULLET POINT MEMO ON BEHALF OF KENT WESTBERRY TO PRESENT TO THE COMMITTEE; CONDUCTED RESEARCH RE COSTS OF IMPEACHMENT.	4.10
1/27/21	RKW	REVIEW BRIEFS PRIOR TO MEETING IN FRANKFORT. CONFERENCE WITH BRIDGET. TRAVEL TO FRANKFORT TO CONFERENCE WITH JASON NEMES AND ATTEND COMMITTEE MEETING. RETURN TO LOUISVILLE.	10.20
1/27/21	BMB	EXTENSIVE CONVERSATIONS WITH KENT WESTBERRY; EMAILS AND TEXTS WITH LAW CLERK; REVIEW STATUTES FROM LEGAL RESEARCH	.80
1/27/21	HR	IN PREPARATION FOR MEMO TO BE PRESENTED TO COMMITTEE, CONDUCTED ADDITIONAL RESEARCH RE COST OF IMPEACHMENT; SPECIFICALLY WHETHER THE PHRASE COST OF INVESTIGATION UNDER KRS 63.070 INCLUDES ATTORNEY'S FEES.	2.40
1/28/21	RKW	WORK ON DRAFT LETTER TO OFFICE OF GOVERNOR. ADDITIONAL WORK ON MEMO TO COMMITTEE. EXCHANGE COMMUNICATIONS AND TELECONFERENCE WITH JASON NEMES. CONFERENCE WITH BRIDGET AND HUNTER.	3.20
1/28/21	вмв	MULTIPLE REVISIONS AND EMAILS RE LETTER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LAW CLERK AND KENT WESTBERRY	.80
1/28/21	HR	IN PREPARATION OF DRAFT OF COMMITTEE REPORT, CONFERENCED WITH KENT AND BRIDGET RE CONTENT OF REPORT AND PLAN MOVING FORWARD.	.70
1/29/21	RKW	ADDITIONAL WORK ON COSTS SECTION OF IMPEACHMENT RESPONSE.	1.80
1/30/21	RKW	REVIEW PETITIONERS RESPONSES INCLUDING THE TREASURER REPORT. ALL FOR CONSIDERATION IN DRAFT RESPONSE.	1.20
1/30/21	вмв	MULTIPLE TEXTS AND EMAILS WITH KENT WESTBERRY, LAW CLERK; REVIEW SOURCES FROM LAW CLERK; LEGAL RESEARCH	2.10
1/30/21	HR ·	IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFT OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT, RESEARCHING HISTORY OF CASE LAW CONCERNING RESTRICTIONS ON WORSHIP IN KY DURING COVID-19 PANDEMIC.	5.40
1/31/21	BMB	NUMEROUS TEXTS WITH LAW CLERK; READ CASE;LAW TO GO IN BULLET POINTS FOR BRIEF; SAME FOR EXECUTIVE ORDERS	5.10
1/31/21	HR	IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFT OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT, RESEARCHING HISTORY OF CASE LAW CONCERNING RESTRICTIONS ON WORSHIP AND IN-PERSON TEACH IN RELIGIOUS PRIVATE SCHOOLS IN KY DURING COVID-19 PANDEMIC.	5.00
2/01/21	RKW	RECEIPT AND REVIEW GOV. OFFICE RESPONSE LETTER. TELECONFERENCE WITH TYLER PEAVLER. REVIEW HOWARD CASE. SEVERAL LATE NIGHT TELECONFERENCES WITH JASON NEMES.	2.60
2/01/21	вмв .	MULTIPLE TEXTS AND EMAILS WITH LAW CLERK; REVIEW SOURCES AND DRAFTS; CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH	2.80
2/01/21	BMB	CHECK JUDGE MCCONNELL'S NEW BOOK ON IMPEACHMENT FOR ADDITIONAL MATERIAL TO ADD TO WHITE PAPER; TEXTS WITH LAW CLERK RE RESEARCH AND WRITING; REVIEW SAME	1.30
2/01/21		IN PREPARATION OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT, DRAFTING SECTION ON FLUX WITHIN LEGAL SYSTEM IN RE TO GOV BESHEAR'S EXECUTIVE ORDERS.	4.30

Dat	e Atty	Description	Hours
2/01/2		IN PREPARATION OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT, DRAFTING SECTION ON ALTERNATE REMEDIES.	1.00
2/02/2	1 RKW	MORE EDITS AND REVISIONS ON BESHEAR REPORT.	3.80
2/02/2	1 BMB	LENGTHY PHONE CALLS, EMAILS AND TEXTS WITH LAW CLERK; REVISE DRAFT. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JASON NEMES.	5.90
2/02/2	1 ВМВ	TEXTS AND PHONE CALLS; REVIEW PLEADINGS FILE AND DISCUSS RESPONSE WITH JASON NEMES.	2.30
2/02/2	1 HR	IN PREPARATION OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT, DRAFTING FINAL DRAFT TO PRESENT TO COMMITTEE.	5.00
2/03/2	1 RKW	MORE REVISIONS ON FIRST BESHEAR REPORT. MULTIPLE TELECONFERENCES WITH BRIDGET. TRAVEL TO FRANKFORT FOR HEARING. ATTEND HEARING. RETURN TO LOUISVILLE.	9.00
2/03/2	1 BMB	REVISE PAPER; RELATED COMMUNICATIONS (CALLS, TEXTS, EMAILS)	.90
2/03/2	1 HR	REVISED/EDITED FINAL DRAFT OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT.	3.80
2/04/2	1 RKW	FINAL REVISIONS PRIOR TO SENDING REPORT.	· .80
2/04/2	1 BMB	REVISIONS PER COMMITTEE; COMMUNICATIONS RE SAME	.40
2/05/2	1 RKW	TRAVEL TO FRANKFORT FOR IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE HEARING. RETURN TO LOUISVILLE. ADDITIONAL TELECONFERENCE WITH AMY CUBBAGE.	6.80
2/05/2	1 BMB	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KENT WESTBERRY, LAW CLERK; NUMEROUS TEXTS AND EMAILS WITH SAME; REVISE BRIEF PER COMMENTS FROM COMMITTEE	.60
2/05/2	1 HR	IN PREPARATION OF IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE REPORT, REVISING FINAL DRAFT OF REPORT.	1.00
. 2/08/2	1 RKW	MORE WORK ON RESPONSE LETTER FROM GOVERNOR'S OFFICE TO COMMITTEE.	.80
2/09/2	1 RKW	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF FINAL DRAFT OF REPORT AND RECEIVED. MAKE EDITS.	1.60
2/11/2	1 RKW	CONFERENCE IN EXECUTIVE SESSION. REVISIONS/EDITS TO REPORT AND RECOMMENDATION.	.40
2/11/2	1 HR	EDITS ON REPORT.	.40
2/13/2	11 HR	DRAFTED MEMORANDUM FOR COMMITTEE ON ALTERNATE REMEDIES TO IMPEACHMENT.	1.50
2/14/2	1 BMB	REVIEW LATEST DRAFT; EMAILS RE SAME	.30
2/16/2	1 RKW	ADDITIONAL REVISIONS ON REPORT AND RECOMMENDATION.	.40
2/17/2	1 RKW		.80
2/19/2	1 RKW	MORE EDITS AND REVISIONS TO PROPOSED FINDINGS. REVIEW SERIES OF EMAILS.	1.20
2/19/2	1 BMB	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KENT WESTBERRY RE MEETING	.10
2/22/2	1 RKW	RESEARCH CENSURE AND EXECUTIVE BRANCH ETHICS COMMISSION APPROPRIATENESS. REVIEW DRAFT OF REPORT AND RECOMMENDATION. ATTEND COMMITTEE HEARING BY ZOOM. DISCUSS PROCEDURE FOR RELEASING REPORT GOING FORWARD.	2.80
2/22/2	1 BMB	TEXT FROM KENT WESTBERRY; PERFORM QUICK LEGAL RESEARCH AT KENT'S REQU ENT; RELATED EMAILS AND TEXTS	.60
2/22/2	.1 HR	DROVE TO FRANKFORT FROM LEXINGTON AT AROUND 12:30PM TO ATTEND IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE MEETING AT 2PM; MEETING ENDED AROUND 3:50PM; DROVE BACK TO LEXINGTON.	1.00
2/22/2	1 HR	WENT OVER BESHEAR REPORT DRAFT WITH COMMITTEE AND MADE EDITS.	.40
2/23/2	1 RKW	REVIEW DRAFT REPORT, PREPARE FOR HEARING.	.60

Date	Atty	Description	Hours
2/23/21	RKW	GO THROUGH REPORT WITH COMMITTEE, MAKE EDITS AND DISCUSS.	1.60
2/23/21	HR · .	DROVE TO FRANKFORT FROM LEXINGTON AT AROUND 3PM TO ATTEND IMPEACHMENT COMMITTEE MEETING AT 4PM; MEETING STARTED AT 6:30PM AND ENDED AROUND 10:45PM; THEN DROVE BACK TO LEXINGTON.	1.30
2/23/21	HR	REVIEWED FINAL DRAFT WITH COMMITTEE AND MAKE FINAL EDITS TO REPORT.	1.30
		Total Professional Services	157.10

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 24,290.50

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Hours	Total
R. KENT WESTBERRY	61.60	12,320.00
BRIDGET MALONEY BUSH	37.40	7,480.00
HUNTER ROMMELMAN	56.10	4,330.50
BUEHNER, ANNIE	2.00	160.00
Total	157.10	\$ 24,290.50

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 24,290.50



Andy Beshear Governor

KENTUCKY STATE POLICE

919 Versailles Road Frankfort, Kentucky 40601 www.kentuckystatepolice.org Mary C. Noble Secretary

Col. Phillip Burnett, Jr. Acting Commissioner

MEMORANDUM

TO:

Lieutenant Jason Palmer, Legislative Security Detail

FROM:

Lieutenant Colonel Kyle J. Nall, Unit 3

DATE:

March 8, 2021

SUBJECT: Average Trooper Salary Re: Costs Incurred in Impeachment Hearings

This memo is intended to document, through an estimated salary rate, the costs incurred by assigning Troopers on the Legislative Security Detail to staff the Impeachment Hearings during the 2021 Regular Session of the Kentucky General Assembly. Below is a table outlining the average salary components and fringe benefit costs associated with the average Kentucky State Police Trooper with up to 5 years of tenure with the agency:

Troopers up to 5 Years	Average Annual	Ave. Annual	Ave. Annual	Annual Average	Ave. Annual	Grand Total
of Service	Base	FICA	Retirement	Health	Life	
Current personnel (303)	\$42,209.40	\$3,229.02	\$60,562.05	\$8,800.00	\$12.00	\$114,812.47
Average per Salary Schedule	\$42,902.74	\$3,282.06	\$61,556.86	\$8,800.00	\$12.00	\$116,553.66

These figures were provided by Rachil Malhotra through a report she generated on the Kentucky Human Resources Information System (KHRIS). In converting the total into an hourly rate (116,553.66/2080), the finding is \$56.04/hour.

After reviewing the schedule provided by the Legislative Research Commission (detailed below), it appears that approximately 19 personnel hours were spent staffing the impeachment hearings.

January 13th - 5:30pm to 6:23pm

1 hour

January 27th – 3:04pm to 5:48pm

2.75 hours

February 3rd – 4:05pm to 7:52pm

3.75 hours

February 4th - 4:51pm to 5:35pm

0.75 hour



Page 2 Memorandum March 8, 2021

February 5 th – 9:12am to 12:25pm	3.25 hours
February 11 th – 8:46pm to 9:57pm	1.25 hours
February 22 nd – 2:09pm to 3:36pm	1.50 hours
February 23 rd - 5:57pm to 10:38pm	4.75 hours

The estimated average cost incurred from staffing these hearings was \$1,064.76. If any additional information is needed regarding this request, please let me know as soon as possible.

Lt. Colonel Kyle J. Nall, Unit 3
Office of Administrative Services

Mmkn0001

KN;kn

2021 Impeachment Committee LRC Staff Time

20 hours January 13 2.5 hours February 3 3.5 February 4 2 hours 5.5 hours February 11 6.5 hours February 23 3.0 hours 1.5 hours February 4 1.5 hours February 11 2.0 hours 1 hour February 22 February 23 1 hour 5.5 hours January 13 2 hours 0.5 hours February 11 February 22 1 hour 2 hours February 23 13.5 hours 2 hours January 13 1.5 hours January 27 4 hours February 3 6 hours February 23 21 hours 3.5 hours January 13 January 20 1 hour 2.5 hours January 27 February 3 4.5 hours 1 hour February 4 February 11 2.5 hours 6 hours February 23 11 hours 2 hours January 13 February 3 2 hours February 11 3 hours

Total 76 hours

February 23

\$2,310.31

4 hours